

## Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Number	Vendor	Item # or Total	Price/Cost	Procurement Officer
15-013				Lisa Goodman
	Moore Medical Administration	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$51.12 No Bid No Bid \$9.00 \$11.25 \$1,536.00 \$64.64 \$14.80 \$16.24	
	Bound Tree Medical	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$1,136.40 \$720.00 \$51.50 \$6.20 \$7.25 \$1,425.60 \$23.80 \$13.60 \$19.32	
	Midwest Medical Supply	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$1,172.00 \$580.86 \$36.00 \$3.00 \$3.75 \$15.44 \$20.68 \$10.96 \$10.24	
	M&M Merchandisers Medical Supply and Equipment	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$228.00 \$774.00 \$49.00 \$3.40 \$4.25 \$280.00 \$15.90 \$12.88 \$14.56	

## Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

<b>Solicitation Number</b>	<b>Vendor</b>	<b>Item # or Total</b>	<b>Price/Cost</b>	<b>Procurement Officer</b>
	Life – Assist, Inc.	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$240.00 \$1,053.00 \$45.00 \$12.00 \$15.00 \$25.20 \$13.96 \$16.80 \$16.40	
	Garden State Medical Supply	Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9	\$261.64 No Bid \$60.65 No Bid No Bid \$15.12 \$20.22 \$13.42 \$14.94	