
Initial Bid Tabulations 
 

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor 
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made. 

 
Solicitation 

Number 
Vendor Item # or 

Total 
Price/Cost Procurement 

Officer 
 

09-102 First In Inc  No Bid Lisa Goodman 
     
 LN Curtis  1a. $485.00  
  1b. $815.00  
  2a. $224.00  
  3a. $182.00  
  3b. $320.00  
  4a. $134.00  
  4b. $243.00  
  5a. $160.00  
  5b. $320.00  
  6a. $21.00  
  6b. $21.00  
  7. $150.00 - $300.00  
     
 LN Curtis 1a. $420.00  
  1b. $670.00  
  2a. No Bid  
  3a. $164.00  
  3b. $290.00  
  4a. $110.00  
  4b. $195.00  
  5a. No Bid  
  5b. No Bid  
  6a. No Bid  
  6b. No Bid  
  7. No Bid  
     
     
     

     



Initial Bid Tabulations 
 

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor 
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made. 

 
Solicitation 

Number 
Vendor Item # or 

Total 
Price/Cost Procurement 

Officer 
 

09-102 Municipal Emergency Services 1a. $382.32 Ted Stallings 
  1b. $615.85  
  2a. $196.34  
  3a. $204.37  
  3b. $380.49  
  4a. $146.34  
  4b. $273.17  
  5a. No Bid  
  5b. No Bid  
  6a. No Bid  
  6b. No Bid  
  7. No Bid  
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     
     

     
 


