
Initial Bid Tabulations 
 

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor 
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made. 

 
Solicitation 

Number 
Vendor Item # or 

Total 
Price/Cost Procurement 

Officer 
 

09-080 Summit Research Labs  No Bid Ted Stallings 
     
 Polydyne  No Bid  
     
 Thatcher Company 1 $44,500.00  
  2A $9875.00  
  2B No Bid  
  3 No Bid  
  4 $10,140.00  
  5 $109,500.00  
     
 Aqua-Serv Eng  No Bid  
     
 Brenntag Pacific 1 $70,000.00  
  2A $9,450.00  
  2B $10,150.00  
  3. No Bid  
  4 $11,520.00  
  5 No Bid  
     
 Hill Brothers 1 No Bid  
  2A $10,750.00  
  2B $$10,750.00  
  3 No Bid  
  4 $14,040.00  
  5 No Bid  
     
 DPC Enterprises  No Bid  
     
 Aqua-Serv Eng  No Bid  

     

 Thatcher Company  Addendum  
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Solicitation 

Number 
Vendor Item # or 

Total 
Price/Cost Procurement 
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09-098 Basic Chemical Sol 1 $36,895.00 Ted Stallings 

  2A No Bid  

  2B No Bid  

  3 No Bid  

  4 No Bid  

  5 $145,000.00  

     

 Univar 1 $45,900.00  

  2A No Bid  

  2B $10,450.00  

  3 No Bid  

  4 No Bid  

  5 No Bid  

     
 


