
Initial Bid Tabulations 
 

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor 
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made. 

 
Solicitation 

Number 
Vendor Item # or 

Total 
Price/Cost Procurement 

Officer 
 

08-178 Water Systems Optimization, 
Inc. 

 No Bid Tony Allen 

     
 Royal Covers of AZ, Inc.  No Bid  
     
 Crawford Mechanical 

Services, Inc. 
7 $76.00  

     
 Southwestern Industrial Sales  No Bid  
     
 Iron Paving & Sealing Coating, 

Inc. 
 13 
14 
16 

$25.00 
$25.00 
$20.00 

 

     
 Compel  No Bid  
     
 Environmental Response, Inc.  No Bid  
     
 Rapid Contracting 13 

14 
$40.28 
$40.28 

 

     
 Star Roofing 6 $49.75  
     
 Hernandez Companies 1 

2 
8 
9 

15 
16 

$55.00 
$45.00 
$65.00 
$70.00 
$55.00 
$35.00 

 

     
 Classic Painting, LLC. 2 $28.00  
     
 Foote Painting, LLC  2 $35.00  
     
 Certi Welders 15 $75.00  
     
 Fabiani Painting & Dec. 2 

16 
$35.00 
$30.00 

 

 

     
 Southwest Trane 7 $97.00  
     
 Piper Power 8 $89.00  
     
 Commonwealth Electric, Co. 10 

11 
$53.00 
$53.00 

 



 GTI Contractors, LLC 1 
2 
3 
4 

12 
13 
14 
16 

$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$25.00 

 

     
 Emmet Refrigeration, LLC 7 $65.00  
     
 A Mind for Detail, Inc. 16 $45.00  
     
 Arizona Repair Masons 12 

13 
14 
16 

$75.00 
$75.00 
$75.00 
$65.00 

 

     
 Skyline Builders & 

Restorations, Inc. 
1 
2 
3 

$35.00 
$32.00 
$35.00 

 

     
 Roto-Rooter Plumbers 8 

9 
$118.45 
$99.75 

 

     
 Crout & Heller Painting 

Supplies 
2 $39.37  

     
 SDB, Contracting Services 1 

3 
15 

$42.30 
$42.30 
$42.30 

 

     
 Liberty Painting Company, 

LLC 
2 $48.00  

     
 M Group Constructors, LLC 1 

2 
3 
5 
6 

12 
13 
14 
15 
16 

$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 
$30.00 

 

     
 PVIC 9 $90.50  
     
 Vortex 4 $75.00  
     
 Spectra Electric Services 10 $43.00  

 


