Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Item # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Pioneer Sand Group 1 Lisa Goodman
Item 1
Delivered $32.00
$38.00
$32.00
Pick-up $38.00
$38.00
$38.00
Group 2
Item 1
Delivered $37.50
$44.50
Pick-up $44.50
$44.50
Item 2
Delivered $30.00
$32.00
$30.00
Pick-up $32.00
$32.00
Item 3
Delivered $26.00
$26.00
$26.00
Pick-up $28.00
$28.00

$28.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Item # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
Cont.
08-129 Pioneer Sand ltem 4 Lisa Goodman
Delivered $20.50
$22.50
$20.50
Pick-up $22.50
$22.50
ltem 5
Delivered $22.50
$25.00
$22.50
Pick-up $25.00
$25.00
Group 3
ltem 1
Delivered $23.50
$25.00
$23.50
Pick-up $25.00
$25.00
ltem 2
Delivered $22.00
No Bid
$22.00
Pick-up No Bid

No Bid




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor ltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
Cont.
08-129 Pioneer Sand ltem 3 Lisa Goodman

Delivered $32.00
No Bid
$32.00
Pick-up No Bid
No Bid

Group 4
Delivered $21.00
$22.50
$21.00
Pick-up $22.50
$22.50
Valley Ace Hardware No Bid

A&A Materials Group 1

Item 1

Delivered $26.60
Pick-up $26.60

Group 2
ltem 1 $23.25
Pick-up No Bid

Item 2

Delivered $34.00
Pick-up $34.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Iltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 A & A Materials ltem 3 Lisa Goodman
Delivered $20.00
Pick-up $20.00
Item 4
Delivered $13.25
Pick-up No Bid
Item 5
Delivered $15.25
Pick-up $15.25
Group 3
Iteml
Delivered $18.50
Pick-up $18.50
Item 2
Delivered $12.50
Pick-up $10.50
Item 3
Delivered $26.00
Pick-up No Bid
Group 4
Delivered $14.00
Pick-up $12.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor ltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Bedrock Stone Co Group 1 Lisa Goodman
Item 1
Delivered $29.50
$30.50
$29.00
Pick-up $29.00
$29.00
$29.00
Group 2
Item 1
Delivered $29.50
$30.50
Pick-up $29.00
$29.00
Item 2
Delivered $35.50
$36.50
$34.50
Pick-up $35.10
$35.00
Item 3
Delivered $21.50
$22.50
$21.00
Pick-up $23.50
$23.50

$23.50




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Item # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Bedrock Stone Co Lisa Goodman
ltem 4
Delivered $16.50
$17.50
$16.00
Pick-up No Bid
No Bid
ltem 5
Delivered $18.50
$19.50
$18.00
Pick-up $18.00
$18.00
Group 3
ltem 1
Delivered $20.00
$21.00
$20.00
Pick-up $21.00
$21.00
Item 2
Delivered $20.00
$21.00
$20.00
Pick-up $21.00

$21.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Item # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Bedrock Stone Co Group 3 Lisa Goodman
ltem 3
Delivered $23.00
$24.00
No Bid
Pick-up No Bid
No Bid
Group 4
Delivered $18.50
$19.50
$18.50
Pick-up $17.50
$17.50
08-129 MDI Rock Group 1
ltem 1
Delivered $32.50
$32.50
$32.00
Pick-up $32.50
$32.50
$32.00
Group 2
ltem 1
Delivered $32.50

$32.50




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Item # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 MDI Rock Pick-up $32.50 Lisa Goodman
$32.50
Item 2
Delivered $39.25
$39.25
$39.25
Pick-up $39.25
$39.25
ltem 3
Delivered $29.00
$29.00
$29.00
Pick-up $29.00
$29.00
$29.00
ltem 4
Delivered $26.00
$26.00
$26.00
Pick-up $26.00
$26.00
ltem 5
Delivered $22.00
$22.00

$22.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Iltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 MDI Rock Pick-up $22.00 Lisa Goodman
$22.00
Group 3
Item 1
Delivered $26.00
$26.00
$26.00
Pick-up $26.00
$26.00
Item 2
Delivered $21.00
$21.00
$21.00
Pick-up $21.00
$21.00
Item 3
Delivered $38.00
$38.00
$38.00
Pick-up $38.00
$38.00
Group 4
Delivered $23.00
$23.00
$23.00
Pick-up $23.00

$23.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Iltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Rock-N-Roll Materials Group 1
Item 1
Delivered $29.00
$30.00
$27.00
Pick-up $28.50
$29.50
$28.00
Group 2
Item 1
Delivered $29.00
$30.00
Pick-up $28.50
$29.50
Item 2
Delivered $38.00
$38.00
$37.50
Pick-up $37.50
$37.50
Item 3
Delivered $24.00
$24.00
$23.50
Pick-up $23.50
$23.50

$23.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor Iltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Rock-N-Roll Materials Lisa Goodman
Item 4
Delivered $15.00
$15.00
$14.00
Pick-up $14.50
$14.50
Item 5
Delivered $15.00
$15.00
$14.00
Pick-up $14.50
$14.50
Group 3
Item 1
Delivered $19.00
$20.00
$18.75
Pick-up $18.75
$19.00
Item 2
Delivered $18.00
$19.00
$18.00
Pick-up $17.75

$18.00




Initial Bid Tabulations

The following table is generated from the initial, raw information collected from Invitations for Bid. Vendor
responsiveness has yet to be established and no award decision has been made.

Solicitation Vendor ltem # or Price/Cost Procurement
Number Total Officer
08-129 Rock-N-Roll Materials Group 3 Lisa Goodman
Item 3
Delivered No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Pick-up No Bid
No Bid
Group 4
Delivered $15.00
$15.00
$14.00
Pick-up $14.00

$15.00




